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Board sets June 17 for "fourth try
The budget election was the topic

of major concern at the May 8 Board
of Education meeting. There was a
iarge group present and much dis-
cussion about the cause of the tax
levy defeat. Possible future action
was also discussed.
LBCC President Raymond Need-

ham told the board why a decision
had to be made about the date of the
next election.
"You might say the state sets

certain dates that we can have
elections. The next possible state
election date is the 17th [June]. I feel
its very important to have our
election on the 17th because our
summer session is slated to start on
the 23rd [June].
"The other item I mentioned, that

we not have registration until budget
commitment. There is no way we can
operate without the local portion. I
think its important we have summer
school for several reasons. We have
in the neighborhood of 650-700
veterans, the majority of them are
planning a year-round educational
program so they can finish in six
straight quarters. Several years alto
we worked on the year-round college
concept so we have many students
who are going straight through on
summer courses. This will be the only

date we couId have a budget com-
pleted and be able to start summer
school. ..
Budget Committeman Chris

Rebmann commented to the board,
"I have been out kind of beating the
brush in the hinterlands and ttiere
are about three basic reasons that I'm
getting signals from, if I'm reading
them right, that is the reason for the
no votes. First I'd like' to say I do
support athletics but...I'm not saying
this is the order of importance but
there are two things that stand out
and that is the athletic program and
the facility itself. There is nothing
anyone can do aboutthe faci Iity but it '
seems most people feel the campus is
quite elaborate. I have been involved
with Linn-Benton since it was a
dream. I was told at that time," said
Rebmann, "there would be no ath-
letics of any kind, none whatsoever.
That the facility was to be of simple
construction, easy to maintain, which
it is. The third reason is the
overlapping courses. We offer the
same courses here that are offered at
OSU and at Monmouth. I don't have
the answer as to what needs to be
done but I'm willing to work on It."
Board member Herb Hammond

felt quite differently about the neg-
ative public vote. "Long before this

Autocross set for Sunday
The Roadrunner Car Club will hold

its lirst autocross Sunday. The auto-
cross will be in the southwest parking
lot. Starting time is 10am and it will
last until about 6pm. The entry fee Is
$3.
An autocross is a curved course

with plastic cones outlining the track.

The object Is to drive the course
quickly without hitting any cones.
The fastest drivers in each class will
receive trophies or plaques.
Drivers must be at least 18 years

old, sign a liability release, have a
valid drivers license, wear a helmet
and seat belt, and drive with windows

school was formed," Hammond said,
"we had people that were sure they
were going to be against the school
because it would have athletics.
These same people are stili telling
you these same things. If we wiped
out the ath letics they would tell you
about the adult education course that
teaches fly tying and that they don't
believe in a school and won't vote for
it as long as you have useless courses
like these. I think," continued
Hammond, "a high percentage of
these people are just not honest
enough to say" don't believe in the
school'. They need to have a crutch
and athletics are a convenient crutch.
I would wager a good sized wager
that you couldn't convince two per
cent of these people to vote for the
college if you wiped out athletics and
several other courses. They would
lind some crutch because they are
just not honest enough to stand up
and say 'I'm against it because I
don't want to put my money in the
school' .
"I agree with you," said Ham-

mond, "that we should de-empha-
size; if we have any control, and I
sure hope we can get cooperation; the
reporting of our small athletic pro-
gram. Even if we have the worst team
in the state it seems like we get a

rolled up. Cars must pass a safety
inspection before being allowed on
the course.
Drivers not interested in the troph-

ies may run the course for time only.
A fee of $1.25 will be charged for
time-only runs, and $.25 of that will
go into a pot for a drawing at the end

three column head and thirty inches
of reportlnq on it and if we take 100
people off the unemployment rolls
and put them to work we may get one
inch. This Isn't critical of the paper,"
Hammond continued, "its just their
judgement. Its a free world, I would
hope we could enlist some co-
operation of all of the news media in
placing athletics in the proper prop-
ortion they occupy."
Board Chairman Kenneth

Haevernick pointed out this fact. "If
we elected to drop athletics and go
back to the voters," said Haevernick,
"we submit the same budget, we
don't drop one dime."
First Vice-President of the As-

sociated Students of LBCC Pauline
Darl ing told the board that a free
market study by the DECA club was
being conducted on the Linn-Benton
areas. A student panel will be formed
representing different facets of LBCC
by talking to groups in the area.
Motion was made and passed

unanimously to allow no registration
until local support was assured:
A meeting was scheduled for May

12 for making the final decision about
suggested budget cuts. 0

of the day. There will also be prize
drawings,
"We are expecting a big turnout if

the weather Is nice," said Dick
Collinson, a member of the club.
Spectators are invited to watch the
autocross and have a picnic on the
lawn," added Collinson, 0
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Levy passage imperative by Fred Southwick

Armageddon is upon us and it is
time for the administrators, the
students, and the entire Linn-Benton
area to face the fact that if the budget
doesn't pass on June 17 there will be
no summer school. Each of these
groups of people must realize that
they are an important part of the
effort which must be put forth to pass
the budget.
It does take a certain amount of

effort to vote. It is especially difficult
for those registered in one area of
Linn or Benton counties and living in
another area. But it is You the results
are going to affect the most, so let's
get with it and begin finding a way to

get to your voting place, and set aside
a time during the day when you can
vote. Your vote does count! Those of
you who wish to do more but not in an
organized way can ask people you
know I your friends, and family
members to vote yes. Stop by your
grand-parents' house or your par-
ents' house and explain to them why
they should vote yes. Let them know
that LBCC is your way to low cost
good education.
What can the administrators do?

What is wrong with approaching
incidental beneficiaries for contrl-
but ions to buy TV and Radio time to
let the voters know exactly what is
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Editor:
Due to an injury, my litter-picking is
down, so I issue an open invitation to
other students to bend a little. If we
have a little pride, let's show It, and
don't forget to push the budget. I

Review

firmly believe LBCC is an asset to the
area, and we need to work together
on this-administration, faculty and
students-you.

Martin B. Altizer

going on. Tell them where their
dollars are going and why. There are
many businesses In this area who
would be financially troubled If the
LBCC shuts its doors for the summer.
The average citizen of this area

may not bel teve the closure of
Linn-Benton would affect them. But
they are wrong! Will your sons and
daughters be competing with more
people for fewer summer jobs? Will
stores near the cotleqe need as many
box-boys, the gas-stations as many
attendants, and the apartments as
many gardeners? Who will make up
for the taxes that will no longer be
levied on the profits that will no

Irish brogue highlights spring production
A bit of old Ireland packaged in

'J.M. Synge's Playboy of the West-
ern World came to LBCC's campus
last weekend. The play was present-
ed by Steve Rossberg's theatrical
group 'in the main forum to a
receptive audience who were cultur-
ally enriched as well as amply
entertained.

It became apparent in the opening
scene that realism coupled with
entertainment was the intent of the
actors as the clear lines of Irish
brogue flowed from the stage. For
some of us it took a few moments to
adjust to the unfamiliar sounds, but
when the task of adjusting was over,
the brogue added much to the
pleasure of watching and listening to
the plot as the play progressed.
. The three acts of the play take
place in an Irish tavern that main-
tains an ample supply of whiskey for
the local Villagers. The opening scene
not only introduces the tavern but
also the presence of Nancy Looman
as Pegeen. Her presence on stage
comes across as Irish as Maureen
O'Hara, with a temper and tongue
befitting any Irish lassie.

Pegeen Is the daughter of the
tavern keeper Michael James Flaher-
ty (played by Charles Mathews) who

/ is planning to attend a wake some
I

distance away with Shawn Keough
(Mike Cooley), Philly (Epplewort),
and Jimmy (Larry Becker).

Shawn Keough, Pegeen's fiance,
has just turned down an Invitation for
himself to spend the night in the
tavern to see to it that Pegeen's
health and safety are guarded during
her father's absence. Young Shawn
declines the Invitation, the thought of
spending the night with Pegeen
unchaperoned being unthinkable!
Shawn Keough, Pegeen's fiance,

has just turned down an invitation for
himself to spend the night in the
tavern to see to it that Pegeen's
health and safety are guarded during
her father's absence. Young Shawn
declines the invitation, the thought of
spending the night with Pegeen
unchaperoned being unthinkable!

Cooley does a superb job in
maintaining the character of Shawn
throughout the play. He contributes a
few independent laughs through his
portrayal of a dependent young Irish
lad, quoting priest, bishop and
scripture in reaching out for author-
ity. Eventually he comes around to
pleading to every known Irish patron
saint that ever was.

In contrast to Shawn is the role of
Christopher Mahon played by Greg-
robin Smith. Smith gave a credible
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performance as a young Irish lad.
Cold, hungry and afraid he wanders
into the remote tavern as the four-
some are preparing to take their
leave for the wake. Christopher is
greeted by Pegeen and the patrons of
the tavern with a mixture of warm
Irish hospitality and all the prying
Inquisitiveness of the villagers. He Is
asked to explain his presence In the
remote place and after a period of
prodding and goading, Christopher
blurts out the truth.

"He has slain his father! For the
last eleven days he has wandered
aimlessly, afraid of being apprehen-
ded by the police. Christopher finds
that he is looking-into the astonished
faces of the villagers as he gives the
details of the scene in which he slays
his father .

He is then accepted and assured
that he will be safe from the police in

- the tavern. Pegeen' s father employs
him and his first duty Is to stay the
night with Pegeen and protect her.
Pegeen's fiance, Shawn is somewhat
perturbed by th is arrangement and

, offers to stay, but Pageen brushes off
his suggestion and instead tells him
to get lost and to join a monastery.

In the morning a group of young
girls come to call on "Christie". They
are Sara (Torrie McAllister), Susan
(Phyllis Williams), Honor (Lisa Rob-
erts) and Nellie (Pat Christman). The
girls are delightful as they paw and
giggle over him but their attention to
Christopher is interrupted by the
entrance of Widow Quin.
Widow Quin's role is played by Ich

Meehan, who does a terrific job of
accurately portraying the image of a
sly seducing widow out to get her
man. Cunning and brazen, Widow
Quin throughout the play attempts to
lure Christopher into her affections.
Offering at various intervals to be
wife, housekeeper, bedwarmer and
mother to him for his own safety.
Fortunately for Christopher, it is
Pegeen who interferes with the
widow's intentions of conquering this
young hero.
Some of the most dramatic and

hilarious scenes in the play come
during its final act. Here we meet
Peter Denton who is cast in the role of
Christopher'S father, old Mahon.
Old Mahon comes to the tavern in

search of his son Christie. His
inquiries soon reveal to the villagers
that he is Christie's father, head
wound and all. Widow Quin is
present when old Mahon makes is
identity known and she cunning ley
convinces him to look somewhere
else. Prior to leaving the old man
thinks he sees his son in a donkey
race but the good widow convinces
him that he is in error. "It's a vision
you're seeing caused by the blow to
your head."

Old Mahon leaves, only to return
later and surprise Christie by his
appearance. They engage in a fist-
fight. Old Mahon attempts to force
his son into submission but Christie
becomes angered by Pegeen's jeer-
ing rejection of him and attempts to
restore his former status by again
slaying his father. In the presence of
the Villagers he picks up a hoe and
striked old Mahon down. The villag-
ers are horrified at the deed he has
committed. They attempt to subdue
him with a rope so that he can be
taken to the police to be hanged.
Christopher is anguished at Pegeen's
rejection of him and fights with the
villagers for his freedom.
Christopher gains his freedom in

the last moments of the playas old
Mahon comes stumbling and mut-
tering into the scene, very alive.
After another brief encounter old
Mahon acknowledges Christie's
manhood, muttering to himself that
he can't understand why 'he is
obeying Christie, he attributes it to
his being crazy.
Christie and old Mahon depart

together believing they have found
the secret to popularity and to good
times. Left behind is Pegeen, who
after having rejected Christie, finds
herself left behind with a broken
heart. She ends the play by saying;
"I've lost the only playboy of the
western world."D

longer be made from selling products
to LBCC's students who will no
longer be here.
Where will the money come from

to replace that which is spent by
Veterans who attend the college?
This is Federal money that will not be
available for the economy of the
Albany area.
If the budget is to pass on June 17,

students must vote. The adminis-
tration must get to the people
through TV and radio spots and the
people must open their minds and
realize that the closing of LBCe
would be a severe economic loss for
the entire Linn-Benton area. D



Tripp elected
OCCA president

Mr. Russell Tripp, a native of
Oregon, has recently been elected
president of the Oregon Community
College Assembly (OCCA). He serv-
ed as vice-president of the OCCA last
year and is an original member of the
local committee which formed LBCC.
Tripp said an important role of

the OCCA is to prove the need for
community colleges so they won't be
left out of state funding. The past
several years have shown enthus-
iastic growth in the thirteen com-
munity colleges of Oregon but "the
honeymoon is over" according to
Tripp. He plans to work with the

Senate appointees chosen
Appointments of two student sen-

ators were announced last Tuesday
by LBCC Student Body President
Phyllis Williams.

New senators named to fill vacan-
cies left by the May elections are:
Jemy Kay and Robert Varner.

Four applications were considered,
from which the two appointments
were made.
Williams stated that there will be

no further applications taken and no
appointments made until September,
when vacancies will be filled after fall
elections.
"We, the student body, need

students who are willing to strive for
good, strong student government.
We need truly qualified applicants,"
said Williams.
Senatorial appointees serve until

the end of the term in which their

LBCC cuts budget
by Mike Viet
Last Monday a special board

meeting was held on campus to
reduce the LBCC proposed operating
bUdget for the June 17 budget
election. Among the discussed pro-
grams and services to be cut are:
$18,370 dollars cut by eliminating

the position of Director of Adult
Education, to replace this office with
a group of current administrative
people. According to LBCC President
Ray Needham, "There wiil be a

re-organization of administrative
policies in the Adult Education
Program. The work will be distribut-
ed between a group of current
administrators so a work balance can
be achieved in this area." There was
no information as to which adminis-
trators the work would be delegated
to.
The X ray Technology course

scheduled for next fall term was cut
and resulted in a reduction of $17,283
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Mr. Russell Tripp

appointment is made. Senators can-
not be reappointed, but may run for
office on the fall ballot. There will be
several vacancies to be filled by
election in September.

Applications for senatorial appoin-
ment are submitted to the executive
council, which interviews each ap-
plicant and in turn submits a report
to the student senate, where the final
decision is made by voting proce-

in the proposed budget. Needham
said he felt by cutting out a proposed
class, no classes now in operation
would be affected or result in
situations not beneficial for the
students of LBCC in their current
choice of classes.
On the upcoming June 17 budget

election, Needham said, "I feel
LBCC has done a good job at
reaching to the people the effects of
our needs for this money to operate

OCCA to stress the importance of
community colleges in the education-
al system. ,. A strong enthusiasm is
needed" to keep the community
colleges going remarked the new
OCCA president. 0

dure.
Each member of the executive

council has one vote and votes wi~h
the senate in its final balloting.

Serving as executive council are
Phyllis Williams, President; Pauline
Darling, 1st Vice President; Steve
Mankle, 2nd Vice President; and
Gritta Somatis, Business Nlanager. 0

next budget term, which begins in
summer term. We do not want to
make changes for people who will
on Iy vote for our budget if we cut out
certain courses or services that t"'~Y
feel .aren't needed. We wish to
maintain a good wide-range or activ-
ities that the communities we serve
benefit from." 0
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Volunteer spring training group. Top center is Rick Wallace. Sunflower's facilitator.

Frustrated? Scream at the bad
guys on T. V. with Uncle Walt (Disney
or Cronkite, your choice).

, Tuned out, turned off, turned on?
Weed, whites and wine flow abun-
dantly in the American Cornucopia.

Stili bummed out, bled your veins
and called It quits? With luck, you'll
call Sunflower House. Real, live
.human beings. Together people car-
ing and sharing their time with you.
You should already know that--Co-

mmuter Informed you Fall Quarter
'74, right? You surely remembered,
and felt wholesome, knowing good

things were being done. And right on
to all that.

Next weekend Sunflower plays the
flip side (no pun intended). A
celebration of what's been done and
what's to come.

It's a chance for Sunflower House
and the people involved to say
thanks, with music, munchies and
material goodies. And a chance for
you to personally help while enjoying
it all. It costs one buck and a happy
head. Magpie, Tom and Theresa,
Neal LaGrande Trio (as if you could
find them all together at one time

anywhere else) would cost you five
times that, including hangover, at
your local watering hole. And taverns
don't give out doorprizes.
The musicians are donating their

talents, community businesses are
giving up quality merchandise for
minimal publicity, civic groups are
providing logistical support. Why?
Government grants are being can-

celled like last year's postage
stamps, and Sunflower needs to pay
its light bills (not to mention free
clinic, drug analysis, medical referal,
staff salaries, and the like necessary

photo by Hugh While

to provide alternatlve services for the
modern age). So a lot of good people
are putting on a good time for nobody
but you.
Come on out and enjoy yourselves.

If it ain't California Jammin', it's
Oregon Boogey at its mellowest.

It's Memorial Day Weeekend, May
25 & 26 at Benton County Fair-
grounds .

Buy your tickets in advance, in the
LBCC commons anytime, and get in
on the doorprizes. 0

, .
Veteran S vorce

Hey vets! If you are planning to
attend summer school this year, or
are concerned about your financial
situation, or both, read on.

The college board of directors has
indicated that summer school at
LBCC Is dependent upon passage of
the budget levy on June 17th. If you
are as concerned as all LBCC
students should be, please plan to
attend the Veterans AlllIOClation
meeting on Monday, May 19th, at
1:15pm In the Santlam Room ICe-
201). If you can't make It at 1:15, It's

still better to come late than not at
all. "'

Discussion will deal with alterna-
tives open to veterans If no summer
school is offered, expression by vets
of their own personal concerns and
what they feel are the views of the
community, and what steps can be
taken to Insure or promote passage of
the budqet on June 17.

Therefore, If you are a concerned
student and wish to accept your share
of the responsibility for operation of
this school, show up In the Santiam
Room on Monday, May 19, at 1 :15
pm. See ya there. 0

Good News From Financial Aids
Department

According to Financial Aids Coun-
selor Rita Lambert, veterans who
were turned down for a Basic
Educational Opportunity Grant (BE
OG) for this year, may now be
eligible for a grant for next year. This
appl res to married vets as well as
single vets.
The filing rules and maximum

income limits have changed since last
year, such that a vet who worked
full-time last year and made more

than the maximum can now file on
the next year's projected income.
Thus, if a vet who worked all lest year
wanted to go to school on the GI Bill
this year, and not work except during
summer term, he could file a grant
application based only upon project-
ed GI Bill income, and be eligible for
a grant in the neighborhood of $450
or more. Needless to say, that would
help your flnaclal situation, would it
not?

For additional details on this
matter, contact Rita Lambert in the
Financial Aids Office (CC-107).O
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Dee Martin accepts
position of Vice-President at PTe
by Jim Perrone
Dee Martin, Director of Commun-

ity Education at LBCC, has accepted
a position as Vice-President of Provo
Technical College at Provo, Utah.
As director of the night-schooi

community education, Martin has
seen his department grow as the
LBCe community has grown. We
asked him for some thoughts on his
involvement at LBCe.
What is your function as Director?
..As Director of Community Edu-

cation at LBCC, the program is
structured to meet the needs of the
LBCC community. Beginning in the
fall term of 1972 there were 40 adult
education classes on the main LBCe
campus. As of fall term 1975 there
were between 145-150 classes offer-
ed, on the LBCC campus alone. This
is the increased community involve-
ment in LBCe's enrollment. We have
the LBCC Campus Center, the Cor-
vallis Community Educational Cen-
ter, the East-Linn Center in Lebanon,
and our most recent addition, a
community educational center in
Sweet Home. In each of these centers
there is a growing interest in our
programs.' ,
How have you felt about your work

at LBCC?
"I feel good about it. In community

education I've been able to develop
the LBCC courses and training
programs to fit the needs of the
people of our various communities.
Also, the apprenticeship program at
Adair Air Force Base is going well.
Its purpose is to train carpentry and
millright skills. My ollice coordinates
the curriculum and teaching aids with
the Joint Apprenticeship Training
Council (JATC).
In June, Martin will take over the

position of Educational Vice-Presi-
dent at Provo, Utah, replacing the
current Vice-President who is to
retire this year. In an article in the
Herald, a newspaper in Provo, Mart ..
in said, "I want to meet the needs of
the people whom the coueqe serves
and keep that uppermost ano fore-
most."
We asked Martin to speak about

the recent budget elections at LBCC.
"I have some reasons why budgets

don't pass in our counties. School
budgets have increased, just as much
as the peoples' cost of living expens-
es have increased in food prices,
gasoline, everything. Owners of

homes have their land assessments
increased resulting in more taxes.
Voting on local school and college
budgets is the oniy way the people
can control money being spent. LBCC
meets more needs of the cross-sec-
tion of community in their education-
al needs-vocational, transfer, what-
ever. Local residents of the LBCC
community just aren't taking a good
look at their community college. Our
LBCC consciousness has spread, but
people haven't stopped to check it
out. "
"There was pressure placed by the

recent budget failure to eliminate the
position of Director of Community
Education," Martin stated, "which
I'm sorry to see go, but the duties
should be carried out well by the
people President Needham will se-
lect. The most important things are to
keep LBCC open to the public'S
interests, to allow a freedom of
selection in education to "serve the
communities LBCC serves, and in
getting to the community the various
forms of education LBCC can oller
them." 0

Photos by Hugh White

Dee Martin
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Awards banquet to honor students
An awards banquet will be held

tonight in the College Center com-
mons to honor outstanding student
performance throughout the past
year.
The Business, Industry, and Food

Services departments will select one
student from each area. "Qualities

looked for are scholarship and lead-
ership to name a few, this is our
chance to show our appreciation as a
group," says secretary skills depart-
ment instructor Dorothy lawrence.
The entertainment for the banquet

will be provided by a group from
Cresent Valley High School. James

C. Howland will be the speaker. He is
a local businessman.
A plaque will be presented to the

student who wins the award. All
students nominated will receive a
certificate.
Other awards given will be to an

outstanding alumni and an outstand-

ing organization which has contribut-
ed the most to LBCC.
The banquet will be held at 7pm.

Over 200 persons have registered for
the banquet. 0

LBCC students
travel to Kansas
Nancy Looman and GregRobin

Smith may be the first Oregonians to
attend the Summer Stock Theater
Company at Emporia Kansas State
College, according to speech and
drama instructor Steve Rossberg.
"Every year approximately 50

actors and actresses are chosen to
participate. in the Summer Stock
Theater Company in Emporia, Kan-
sas," Rossberg said. "In ten ~weeks.
beginning June 2, the company does
six productions. The participants act,
build scenery, work with lighting,
and work as technicians," Rossbel'"~
continued. ! '

"It is very intense. They will work
8-14 hours a day, seven days a
week," explained Rossberg.
"At first they will work on improv-
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~~~"""~~~~IIlIIIII!""~"!'"'!'!'!"~~~GregRobin Smith and Nancy Looman in the production of Playboy of the
Western World.
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Records fall at Lane track meet
As expected Lane won last Satur-

day's conference meet held on their
home track. The LBCC Track squad
could· only manage a fifth place
among the nine teams entered, but
• coach Dave Bakely was pleased.

"We had seven school records,"
Bakely beamed. "You just can't feel
bad about efforts like that."
Don Dean tall ied the lone LBCC

first place. It came in the long jump
where he had a leap of 23-7V2. It was
a school record and good enough to
qualify him for the national meet to
be held later this month in Pasadena,
Texas. "He really came through for
us... but then he always does,"
Bakely said of the frosh jumper. Dean
also set a school record in the triple
jump as he flew 43-11 V2.

inn-Benton bri ht s at

came in the mile relay, with a school
record time of 3:25.6. The team of
Randy Westbrook, Tim Hobbs, Mark
Robinson and Pete Sekermestrovich
put together an effort that was good
for a fourth place. "All four of them
finally got it together," Bakely said
.and then went on, "They can run
even faster if they think they can."
Tim Hobbs broke his own record in

the 100 with a 10.3 in the qualifying
heats. "I got in a fast heat, in the
other one two guys qualified with
times slower than mine ... 10.5 and
10.6;'" the soph sprinter sighed. "In
the finals they even ran slower."
Hobbs time of 10.3 would have tied
him for second in the slow final.
Randy Westbrook toured the 440 in

a school record lime of 51.2, to add to
n n' oints with a fourth

place. "They were all so fast," he
said referring to the competition. "I
couldn't help but go fast just to stay
near them."
With a throw of 120-9 in the discus

Randy Abraham was able to establish
a new school record. "He has been
throwing in the low teens and some
times even lower, so he really
·improved," Bakely said. "He'll get
better, a lot better."
The final school record came in the

shot put. Andy Zotola heaved the 16
pound ball 43-1. Zotola too had been
throwing well under that mark for
much of the season. "both of our
weight· records are starting to get
respectable," Bakely said of Zotola
and Abraham's efforts.
In the poie vault Roadrunner Rick

Paine tied the record with a lurn of

isations to help in getting used to
working with each other, " said
Rossberg. The productions include;
The Apple Tree (a musical), Love
Rides the Rails (a melodrama), The
Mousetrap, Prisoner of Second Ave-
nue, Arsenic and Old Lace, and two
one act plays by Elaine May.
Looman and Smith had the leads in

the recent LBCC production of Play'
boy of the Western World.
"To attend the Summer Stock

Theater Company you must apply
and have letters of recommendation
sent to the college," said Rossberg.
"Only about 50 people are accepted,
usually from the midwest states.
Only 10 of those 50 receive scholar-
ships. Both GregRobin and Nancy are
receiving one," he said. 0

13-6. He now shares the mark with
Chris Watkins, who set the record
three weeks ago. "Rick could go 14
feet if he would get his head into it,"
Bakely went on, "He cleared 13-6
with very little problem, but then he
got to 14 and didn't come near."
"It was a good meet, we had a few

bad breaks but I thought we did
pretty well despite them," Bakely
said, thinking back.
The team scores were as follows:

Lane 189, Clackamas 102, Central
Oregon 82, Southwestern 78, l.inn-
Benton 47'14, Umpqua 29, Judson
Baptist 25, Blue Mountain 21V2,
Chemeketa 163;".
Today and tomorrow the Roadrun-

ner trackmen will be participating in
the regional meet to be held in
Salem. 0



Soccer team forming
This country has seen a sudden

increase in the sport of soccer. Here
at LBCC it is apparently no dillerent.
Most every afternoon you can look

out in the field behind the Activities
Center and see a cluster of would be
soccer players trying to sharpen their
skills to the European game.
One of the usual players and

member of the Albany Soccer Club is
Tim Howarth. "It's really healthy,
it's really active," he said. Last year
was the first year for the Albany
Soccer Club. It was also Howarth's
first year playing organized soccer.
"There's just as much aggression as
football, but more skill involved,"
Howarth said, when explaining the
game. "People are just now starting

illLanham
Far afield

Roach Clill does his thing in prep-
eration for a "big happening".

"I guess my sport has been
overlooked for a long time although
ever since the peace movements have
begun myself and my fellow atheletes
have been in there doing our best."
A thought on the past and on the
present by a man most' people
consider a freak!

to accept European ideas ... Soccer is
growing in this country. It

Those who are interested in play-
ing for fun during the afternoon are
encouraged. "The more people the
better the game it is, .. Howarth
explained. People interested In the
afternoon activities and maybe an
intramural type competition, can get
information all the posters that are
up around the campus, or can contact
John Wenger.

Those interested In a more serious
and higher level competition found
through the Albany Soccer Club can
find the team practicing on Wed-
nesday nights at 6pm on the South
Albany High practice field. 0

"I guess I've thrown a frisbee In
just about every major demonstration
in the last eight years," Roach Clill
stated when talking of his past
achievements.
Clill, a tall dark-skinned man of

about 30 explained that he had been
participating in the sports that fre-
quent most anti-war demonstrations
and others of its sort. Some of the
sports include Fist Clenching for the
longest time, Bottle, Brick and Bomb
throwing. and of course the classic
Frisbee with a lead liner throw.
"Some of the sports may sound a

bit obscure but it takes a lot of
concentration and practice to be able
to hit a cop or administrator at 40
yards," Cliff went on to say, "Some-
times I practice for hours a day to
perfect my throwing or clenching, the
neighbors are always complaining."
Roach got his start during the

Chicago riots. He found himself
being attacked and the only thing he
could do was throw a frisbee. "It
saved my life!" Did he hit the cop?
"No the stupid thing went so far that

Commuler. May 18, 1875 7

Rod Husain, originally from Trinidad, West Indies, coach.
djf·~· :.0, ). .~"i.
pholo by Hugh White

everybody stopped their fighting to
watch it..1 just ran!"
How does he view his sport today?

"Well the war has ended so there are
no protests ... 1don't think Ford knew
quite what the impact would be if the
thing ended, 1 mean he put a lot of
people out of business!" Roach
explained, "I tried to organize an
anti-aerosol can rally but the thing
went up in smoke."
Cliff still manages to find a little

competition but not much. "Oh, now
and then a strike at a supermarket
comes up or something small like that
but not too much to lose sleep over. It

He added, "My dream is to be the
first master competetor, I can't even
find the competition now, much less
after I am 40 years old!"
"I'm getting kinda old," he re-

flected. "I guess the excitement sort
of leaves you ... the thrill is gone. But
that is kinda the way I feel. .. it's
tough to grow old!"
Roach competes in all the events

although most competitors only go in
one or two. "I can do most all the

IludweIeeT on Tap
Sandw_ & Live M",,1e

Happy Hour E... ryl!ay 5-6 p.'!'.

2235N.Nlntlt,Corvall~Oregon

PRESENTS
Saturday 9 to 1
-Bum's Rush-

"Bluegrass at its' finest"

Sunday 9 to 1
The Mellow Sounds of
Paul Lemoine
Wednesday9 to 1

-Neal LaGrande Trio-
"Hot jazz, a la Herbie Hancock

events well but not great," he said,
assessing his talents. "I feel a certain
amount of satisfaction though."
He summed up his goals, "I'm

happy in my activities, and I'll keep
doing them if I can only find a
cause!"
A man without a cause ... but as the

saying goes, "He sold his soul for
peanuts, and got none. 0

Colony
~Inn
~7950

On a 3 month lease

8450 Month to Month

Pool Now
.Open

Come and meet the managers
FRANK & BETTY WASSON

1042 S.W. Belmont
Next to LBCC
928-1500
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FOR SALE

FOR SALE: KenwOOd KR·77 FM/ AM
Receiver, 2 Sansui 2000 speakers (70
watt), Dual 1218 turntable. sacrifice for
$375 see Bob Byington or call 258-8783.

Trailwlse SlImline Northern goose down
bag. Made for Skl-Hut. Has a 32 oz. flU
with an 8' loft. Excellent condition. This
is 8 backpacking mummy bag. Gall
926-7147. If no answer call again,
anytime!

FOR SALE: 1972 Mazda Pickup low
mileage, Eden Valley canopy, $2,195.
Contact AI Walczak Ex. 214 or 928-8401

FOR SALE 35mm Kodak Camera with
leather case. 2 speeds 1/4Oth & 1180th
sec. NOT A SLR. 15 years old, but never
used. Has light meter built In. see D.
Wright/Graphic Comm.

STEREO SYSTEM FOR SALE! gecerv-
er/Amp: Olsen 20 Watt RMS; Cassette:
Player / aeccrcer-Amcex: Turntable:
Garrard 40B; Accessories: 4 mikes,
De--Mag. (Eraser) Two-2 way suspension
speakers. ONLY $200.00 Leave message
for Dina at ext. 257

'63 Falcon $175 926-3296 evenings.
Honda CB 350, $450.00, 10,000 miles
926-3296 evenings.

1967 Rebel SST Light metallic blue
wI black vinyl top, Reclining bucket seats
and radio. Automatic 290-V8 with power
brakes/steering. Complete tune-up and
oil change in late March. ~.OO Snow'
Tires Included. 752-6484. Ask for Trudl.

..

QUALITY APPALOOSA HORSES-Nat·
ionally known bloodlines. Dispersal sale
priced from $350-$1,500. 928-5626 after
5pm.

FOR SALE 1969 CHEV. IMPALA 20,
HT, 396 C.I.D. turoo..hyd., PS, P.B., tilt
steering wheel, vinyl top, extra snow tires
& chains, good mileage, very clean,
65,000 miles, very good condition.
$1,150.00 928--8253
For Sale Berkey/Keystone electronic
calculators. 20 function Scienttflc models'
with 2 yr. guarantee. New $89.50. Also
have a couple 4 function models With %
key and memory for $49.50, charger and
carrying case. Battery operated unit for
$29.50. see Bob Ward in H-118, Tues.
and Thurs. 1~4pm or call 745-7190
evenings.
Moving to Alaska-Need moneyl 1974
Yamaha 360 Enduro 4000 miles, New
trials tires, tuned less than 150 miles ago,
looks like new, presently licensed. In-
cluded also are two helmets plus leather
jacket size 38. Sacrifice all for S6OO.00.
call after 6pm 259-1310 ask for Tom.

Flute-Artley Artist model, open~hole,
good tone, great condition. $150.00 see
Leslie at College Center office or call
928-7088.

Maggie May 13th is for aale... your big
chance to own royalty~ The world's one
and only iong·halred Bassett Hound. 1 yr.
old, spayed, AKC registered. This ex·
ceptionally speedy, Intelligent long~
eared, sac: eyed dog can be yours for the
best offer over $50. Cail 928-5626 after
5pm or ext. 257 ask for Linda.

FOR SALE 1975 Ben Hogan golf Irons,
left handed. 0-2 swing wt. Call Steve
753-3334

FOR SALE 1963 Chevy Impala 5.5. Good
transportation.' 15-18 m.p.g. $325.00.
call 928-4364

lWl N BEDS and matching chest of
drawers, Includes mattress and box
springs. $125.00call928--5826 after 5pm.

PalrlSylvaniaspeakers.12lnch Woofers.
Excellent condition cost $200 new. sell
$75. 928--3246or see Doug McLeod.

For sale:21h h.p. Wards chain saw 24"
bar~WIll trade-Make otfer·CaIl 928-2361
ext. 257 ask for AI or leave message.

Mechanics special. 1970 Maverick 2door
automatic. Runs but needs rings. Two
new radial tires, Interior good. $900 call
928-5826.
Johnson 323 Meesenger 23 channel CB
radio. Mobile or base. Asking $220.00 .•
Calf 9~20 eve.
1971 Honda 350 SL. Great for street or
trail. Excellent Cond.-Must sell. $325.~
928-4082.

HELP WANTED
People who want to earn $100.00 to
$1,000 per month PIT from their own
homes. Call 753-4609

BABYSlTIER. Female,own transporta-
tion preferred. Hours: 4pm to 12am and
6pm to 2:30 am. Phone 928-4379.

NEEDED: PEOPLE POWER-Lebanon
students who would be available to put up
lawn sign in Lebanon prior to the budget
election May 6. Please leave your name,
address, and telephone number at the.
Purchasing Oflice-CG-133 as soon as
possible.

SumryJerEmployment for forestry majors;
$3.46 hr. Forest Inventory project west of
Eugene, Oregon. Work includes field
sampling, acreage measurement, check-
Ing field data and working with pretypes.
Requires experience or training In d-tape,
clinometer, rereekop. prism, aerLaI pho-
tography interpretation, and tree species.
For information or application forms,
contact LBCC Placement Office, CG-107.

NEED MONEY? Call 926-9922.

WANTED
WANTED: HARD~SHELL GUITAR
CASE for classical guitar. Reasonable
price and In reasonable shape. Call
752~8709evenings.

Anyone interested In taking Physics
21'1,212,213with Calculus, '75-'76 Please
contact Eric Dorondo at 491~3981 or at
ST~130,MTWF at 11am or Frank Nltcner
at 926-1052. Minimum of 12 students
needed.

Lens wanted-105 mm or 135 mm tele-
photo, threaded for Pentax. Will buy, or
swap for my 28mm Takamar wloe-angle.
Call 926-7394, ask for Hugh. Or leave
message at Commuter office.
Wanted to purchase. March "74" Hot
Rod magazine, also 57 Chevy parts, 57
Pontiac rear end, Chevy 4 speed trans.,
409 block and parts. Gall 752·1020ask for
Ken or leave message.

I'd like to meet with anyone whose
birlhdate Is November 20th. Especially
individuals born In 1953. Of equal
importance Is the hour of birth (between 2
& 3pm). Could Include dinner engag&
ment. Call Ed Dahl, Ext. 390 or 926-7193.

WANTED Used potters w:leel. Rea-
sonable please! call 928-4364
Folk Guitar. Willing to pay $25.00 Call
926--7147If no answer, please call again.

FREE'BIE:S

Labrador Retriever, 9 months old female,
pur&bred but small for a retriever, has
ali shots, etc. "Rooney" is a good house
dog though she does need to be exercised
regularly. Free to a caring home. Call
Ann Marie Walker ext. 351 or home,
928-1935.

FREE-FANTASTIC FECES. Triple A~1
Appaloosa horse manure (the best kind)
mixed with straw. Mulch for garden or
sfack it around your house to remind you
of the good old days down on the farm.
U-HAUL. TA Ranch 928-5626.
SUMMER JOBS Free info. Just write to
Scientific and Professional Enterprises
College Division 2237 El camino Real,
Palo Alto, calif. 9-4306

Tortoise shell kitten. Free! Genuine! This
kind of cat doesn't have scent glands,
always smells freshly washed, ready to
go. D. Wright! Humanities

Two year old Great Dane needs a home.
Bart's image makes him a good watch
dog and only you will know what a
powder puff he Is. Have to move to a
place he wouldn't like. call 752·3951 or
see John Springer around Commons_

TERM PAPERS

TERM PAPERSl Canada's largest
s~ice. For catalogue send $2 to: Essay
Services, Box 1218, Niagara Falls, New
York 14302 (416) 366-6549

SE,RVICES AVAILABLE

STOP! Do you needlyping done at.a very
reasonable rate? Pick up and deliver.
Need a Tutor In Business Math, BasH:
Math, Elements of Algebra, Shorthand,
FORTRAN, and,.more? call 753--3217,
ask for Lucy Inggam. I'm .available at
LBCC.
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hiring now
-guaranteed income
-no investment required
-will train
·part or full time

For appointment call:
928-8439 or 928-7128
Weekdays before 9:00 am and 7:00 pm
Anytime on weekends ...

The Adult Shop
CALL FOR MOVIE TITLE

212 E. 1st Albany
926·0907

of N\lsk Presents
COUlltlin("~"01\1'~;:- , SUf\l\)A"~ MAV 2-5

.1PM-1AM
MONDAY, MAY 2.0

It ~OAM-2"'M
: $l.APUlTS 504k:1PS
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•
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,,~PACK
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&~~
RECREATIONAL SPORTS

WAREHOUSE INC~
311 SW Madison

TWO MAN RAFT

BUOYANCY: 450+ Pounds

WEIGHT: 3.75 Pounds

The Pack/Raft is a valuable piece of fine
equipment. Not only for the backpacker, but
also the auto traveler, camper, motorcyclist,
housebooter, skin or scuba diver. This in-
flatable boot is unique, light, compoct and
durable.

752-5612


